SHERIFF ~—

Bradford County

Gordon Smith, Sheriff

s _‘/ °

09/12/2022

To whom it may concern,

The Bradford County Sheriff’s Office received sealed bids after posting the Request for Proposal in
the Bradford County Telegraph and on our website. On 09/06/22, in the lobby of the Sheriff's Office @
10:00 am the following bids were received.

1) Bozard Ford
2) Duval Ford
3) Duval Chevrolet

Following a Command Staff review of the proposals, the following contracts were awarded based on
the evaluation table described in the Request for Proposal.

Ford vehicles;
Primary Contract Awarded to Duval Ford
Alternate Awarded to Bozard Ford

Chevrolet vehicles:
Primary Contract Awarded to Duval Chevrolet
Alternate- No Bid

Other manufacturers:
No Bid

Information regarding the Contract (BCSO 22-27-1.0) and the Proposals will be listed on our website
(bradfordsheriff.org) under the Finance section. For any questions or concerns please contact me during
regular business hours.

Thanks, (
I /
MaﬂSFGeow L Konkel Jr.
Chief of Operations
Bradford County Sheriff’s Office
945-B North Temple Ave.
Starke, Fl. 32091
Office (904)966-6306
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Sheriff Gordon Smith
945-B North Temple Avenue
Starke, FL 32091

BRADFORD COUNTY
SHERIFF’S OFFICE

Gordon Smith
Sheriff

BRADFORD COUNTY SHERIFF’S

OFFICE VEHICLE PURCHASING
CONTRACT BCSO (22-27-1.0)

EXECUTED: <, /.T/ZC =
EFFECTIVE: September 12, 2022
TERM: FIVE (5) Years with Option to Extend/Renew
ATTACHMENTS: A. SPECIFICATIONS
B. PRICING AND DISCOUNTS

TERMS AND CONDITIONS =

This AGREEMENT is established by and between Bozard Ford, (hereinafter referred to as
“VENDOR”) whose address is 540 Outlet Mall Blvd (St. Augustine, F1.) and any duly authorized
appointee of the Bradford County Sheriff’s Office, an independent constitutional officer with
administrative offices at 945B N TEMPLE AVE; STARKE, Florida (hereinafter referredto as .
“SHERIFF”) (collectively hereinafter referred to as “PARTIES”).

WHEREAS; VENDOR wishes to enter into a contractual relationship with SHERIFF for
the provision of goods or services;

WHEREAS; VENDOR agrees to provide goods and services to SHERIFF, as he may
request from time to time, based upon all terms and conditions contained in official Purchase Orders
referencing this AGREEMENT which are incorporated herein; and

WHEREAS; SHERIFF requires all VENDORS to agree with and comply with, the terms
and conditions of this AGREEMENT as detailed herein.

NOW THEREFORE, as a condition precedent to entering into a contractual relationship
with the SHERIFF, the VENDOR agrees as follows:

A. GENERAL

VENDOR understands that this is not an exclusive contract with SHERIFF for the provision of
goods and services. SHERIFF may utilize other vendors without penalty or cost to SHERIFF.

The PARTIES agree that to the extent VENDOR’s Contract/Invoice, or any subsequent contract,
1
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invoice, or addendum, contains any terms or conditions which are in conflict with or require any
action that conflicts with the terms contained in this AGREEMENT, the terms of this
AGREEMENT shall control - regardless of the order of execution of these documents.

The VENDOR shall not change the terms and conditions contained herein unless such change is
in writing and executed by the PARTIES. Failure to deliver or to comply with any of the terms
and conditions of this AGREEMENT may disqualify VENDOR from receiving future orders.

B. QUALITY

All materials or services furnished by VENDOR must be as specified, and subject to inspection
and approval by SHERIFF within a reasonable time after delivery at destination. Variations in
materials or services from those specified in this order must not be made without written
authorization from SHERIFF. Materials rejected will be returned at the VENDOR’s risk and

expense.
C. QUANTITY/PRICE

The quantity of materials ordered, or the prices specified, must not be exceeded without written
authorization being first obtained from SHERIFF. Prices quoted will include a discount off MSRP
and/ or the percentage markup over vendor cost as contained in the vendor bid document. Discounts
off manufacturer’s price lists will be reflected on quotes per vendor’s bid submission and will be
extended to manufacturer and dealer installed options. Quotes must follow the outline set forth in the
quote template section “m” contained in the bid announcement, terms and conditions. [see attachments]

D. INDEMNITY AND INSURANCE

SHERIFF agrees to be responsible for the acts or omissions of his employees to the extent permitted
under Florida law. Nothing herein shall operate as a waiver of SHERIFF’S sovereign immunity.
SHERIFF does not agree to indemnify or hold harmless VENDOR. There are no intended third-
party beneficiaries arising out of or in any way connected to this AGREEMENT, and nothing herein
shall be construed to grant any person, firm, or other entity which is not a signatory to this
AGREEMENT any rights, benefits, or privileges to rely on or demand performance of any provision
of this AGREEMENT. VENDOR further agrees to provideworkers’ compensation coverage for all
of VENDOR'’S employees, and to maintain such generaland auto liability insurance as is deemed
necessary by SHERIFF for the circumstances and operations of VENDOR. VENDOR further agrees
to provide SHERIFF with Certificates of Insurance, indicating the amount of coverage in force,

upon request.
E. PACKING

Packages must be plainly marked with shipper’s name and Purchase Order number. Charges are not
allowed for boxing or crating unless previously agreed upon in writing.

F.  DELIVERY

All materials must be shipped F.O.B. Destination. SHERIFF will not pay freight or express charges.
If a specific purchase is negotiated on the basis of F.O.B. shipping point, VENDOR IS TO PREPAY
SHIPPING CHARGES AND ADD TO INVOICE:
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Upon receipt of a Purchase Order under this AGREEMENT, the VENDOR shall contact the
SHERIFF to confirm the order and a mutually agreeable delivery date. Deliveries shall be made
between 8:30 A.M. and 4:30 P.M. Monday through Friday, except for holidays, unless otherwise
stated.

G. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET VENDOR agrees to furnish SHERIFF with a
current Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) on or before delivery as required by Florida Statute.

H. OSHA REQUIREMENT

VENDOR hereby guarantees SHERIFF that all materials, supplies and equipment as listed on the
purchase order meet the requirements, specifications and standards as provided for under the Federal
Occupations Safety and Health Act of 1970, as from time to time amendcd and in force atthe date

hereof.
1. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES

Pursuant to Section 287.133 (2) Florida Statutes, a person or affiliate who has been placed on the
convicted vendor list following a conviction for a public entity crime may not submit a bid,
proposal, or reply on a contract to provide any goods or services to a public entity; may not submit
a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract with a public entity for the construction or repair of a public
building or public work; may not submit bids, proposals, or replies on leases of real property to a
public entity; may not be awarded or perform work as a contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or
consultant under a contract with any public entity; and may not transact business with any public
entity in excess of the threshold amount provided in Section 287.017, for CATEGORY TWO
($25,000) for a period of 36 months following the date of being placed on the convicted vendor
list. VENDOR hereby swears or affirms that it isn’t currently on any such list or otherwise been
suspended or barred from providing services or products by any local, state of federal regulatory
or governmental entity.

J. PROMPT PAYMENT ACT

Contained below are provisions of Chapter 218, Florida Statutes, which regulates payments made by local
governmental entities for non-construction services or goods. As an Independent Elected Constitutional
Office, SHERIFF is bound by the provisions of this Chapter and all contracts entered into between SHERIFF
and private vendors are governed by its terms. This section shall extend to the eligible governmental
agencies as qualified users of this agreement which are statutorily referred to as: “Governmental agency”
means a county, a municipality, a district school board, or any other unit of local government or political
subdivision in this state.

Attached below are the pertinent parts of Chapter 218, Florida Statutes, relating to payments made
by SHERIFF. These requirements supersede any terms in agreements entered into between the
SHERIFF and any vendor or contractor doing business with SHERIFF.

The time at which payment is due for purchases made by SHERIFF shall be calculated from:

1. The date on which a proper invoice is received by the chief disbursement officer of the
3
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local governmental entity after approval by the governing body, if required; or

2. Ifaproper invoice is not received by the local governmental entity, the date:
a. On which delivery of personal property is accepted by the local governmental
entity;
b. On which services are completed;
c.  On which the rental period begins; or

d. On which SHERIFF and VENDOR agree in a contract that provides dates
relative to payment periods; whichever date is latest.

3. SHERIFF shall establish procedures whereby each payment request or invoice received by
it is marked as received on the date on which it is delivered to an agent or employee of
SHERIFF or of a facility or office of the SHERIFF.

4. The payment due date for contracts for the purchase of goods or services is 45 days after
the date specified in s. 218.73. The payment due date for the purchase of construction
services is specified in s. 218.735.

5. If the terms under which a purchase is made allow for partial deliveries and a payment
request or proper invoice 1s submitted for a partial delivery, the time for payment for the
partial delivery must be calculated from the time of the partial delivery and the submission
of the payment request or invoice in the same manner as provided ins. 218.73 or s. 218.735.

6. All payments, due from SHERIFF and not made within the time specified by this section
bear interest from 30 days after the due date at the rate of 1 percent per month on the unpaid
balance. VENDOR must invoice the local governmental entity for any interest accrued in
order to receive the interest payment. Any overdue period of less than 1 month isconsidered
as 1 month in computing interest. Unpaid interest is compounded monthly. Forthe purposes
of this section, the term “1 month” means a period beginning on any day of one month and
ending on the same day of the following month.

K. SCRUTINIZED VENDOR LIST

By executing this Agreement, VENDOR certifies that: it is not on the Scrutinized Companies that
Boycott Israel List, created pursuant to Section 215.4725, Florida Statutes, or engaged in a boycott
of Israel; and, for bids, proposals or contracts for goods or services of one million ($1,000,000) dollars
or more, that it is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, or engaged in business
operations in Cuba or Syria, per Section 287.135, Florida Statutes. If SHERIFF determines, using
credible information available to the public, that VENDOR has submitted a false certification,
SHERIFF shall provide VENDOR with written notice of its determination. VENDOR shall have
ninety (90) days following receipt of the notice to respond in writing and to demonstrate that the
determination of false certification was made in error. If VENDOR does not make such
demonstration within ninety (90) days after receipt of the notice, SHERIFF shall bring a civil action
against VENDOR. If a civil action is brought and the court determines that VENDOR has submitted
a false certification, VENDOR shall pay a civil penalty equal to the greater of two million
($2,000,000) dollars or twice the amount of the contract for which the false certification was
submitted, and all reasonable attorney fees and costs, including any costs for investigations that led
to the finding of false certification; and, VENDOR will be ineligible to bid on any contract with an
agency or local governmental entity for three (3) years after the date SHERIFF determined that
VENDOR submitted a false certification, pursuant Section 287.135(5)(a), Florida Statutes
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L. GOVERNING LAW, JURISDICTION AND VENUE

The terms and conditions of this agreement shall be construed in accordance with and governed by
the laws of the State of Florida. All actions, whether sounding in contract or in tort, relating tothe
validity, construction, interpretation, and enforcement of this AGREEMENT shall be institutedand
litigated in the courts of the State of Florida, located in Bradford County, Florida, without regardto
conflicts of laws principles. In accordance herewith, the parties to this AGREEMENT submit to the
jurisdiction of the courts of the State of Florida located in Bradford County, Florida.

M. ARBITRATION/MEDIATION

SHERIFF does not agree to binding arbitration or mediation nor waive SHERIFF’S right to use the
courts in the event that a breach or other circumstance necessitates litigation as a tool to ensurethat
the rights of the agency and the citizenry are protected.

N. WARRANTY
SHERIFF does not agree to waive direct, special or exemplary damages.

0. SECURITY

Due to the confidential and sensitive nature of the work performed by SHERIFF, VENDOR and
contractors may be subjected to background checks upon SHERIFF’S request. VENDOR and
contractors may be required to provide information about themselves, their employees, and
subcontractors, in order to permit SHERIFF to conduct background checks on persons entering
secure areas, accessing secure information or otherwise providing supplies or services to
SHERIFF. SHERIFF retains the right to limit or refuse access to any person at his sole discretion
and vendors and contractors agree to abide that decision without cost or penalty to SHERIFF.

P. TERMINATION

This AGREEMENT may be terminated at any time by SHERIFF, for any reason or no reason at all,
upon providing thirty (30) days advance written notice to the VENDOR. SHERIFF shall payfor all
supplies and services provided by VENDOR as of the date of termination.

Q. APPROPRIATION

This AGREEMENT is subject to availability and annual appropriation of funds by the County,
County Council, (Council). If funding for vehicle purchasing is not appropriated by the Council for
any fiscal period during the term hereof, then SHERIFF shall immediately terminate this
AGREEMENT upon written notice to VENDOR. In the event of suchtermination, VENDOR shall
be entitled to receive just and equitable compensation for any satisfactory work performed as of the
termination date. Such termination by SHERIFF shall not be deemed a Breach of Contract by
SHERIFF, and VENDOR shall have no right to any actual, general, specific, incidental,
consequential, or any other damages whatsoever of any description or amount.

R. MISCELLANEOUS
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None of the following terms shall have any effect or be enforceable against SHERIFF or any of his
employees or agents:

1. Any term requiring SHERIFF to maintain any type of insurance for the benefit of either
SHERIFF or VENDOR.

2. Any term granting VENDOR any security interest in property owned or controlled by

SHERIFF, including facilities provided by the County Board of County Commissioners

for use by SHERIFF.

Any term obligating SHERIFF to pay the costs of collection or attorney’s fees.

4. Any term allowing VENDOR to make unilateral modification to any contract entered into
or relied upon by the Parties.

5. Any term requiring or stating that the terms of VENDOR’S standard form contract shall
prevail over the terms of this Agreement in the event of a conflict.

6. Any term granting VENDOR the right to audit or examine the books, records or accounts
of SHERIFF other than as required by law.

PJ

S. PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

Chapter 119, FS, is Florida’s Public Records Act. Under this law, all records, including contracts
are subject to disclosure to the public on demand. There are certain exemptions that can be claimedby
SHERIFF to shield certain protected information, but VENDOR is hereby put on notice that the
terms and conditions of any agreement entered into between VENDOR and SHERIFF are likely be
disclosed if a public demand is made. SHERIFF does not agree to the confidentiality ofany
information contained within any documents created or developed as part of any agreement. The
Public Records law will always supersede any agreements to the contrary.

The NOTICE provided below is required to be part of any agreement entered into by SHERIFF.

NOTICE

IF THE CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE APPLICATION OF
CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO THE CONTRACTOR'S DUTY TO
PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING TO THIS CONTRACT, CONTACT THE
CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS FOR THE COUNTY.

In compliance with 119.0701, Florida Statutes, and 119.011(2), Florida Statutes, the following
definitions shall apply to this agreement:

"Contractor" means an individual, partnership, corporation, or business entity that enters into a
contract for services with a public agency and is acting on behalf of the public agencyas provided
under s. 119.011(2).

"Public agency" means a state, county, district, authority, or municipal officer, or department,
division, board, burcau, commission, or other separate unit of government created or

established by law.
Note that in accordance with Florida law the contractor shall:
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Keep and maintain public records that ordinarily and necessarily would be required by the
public agency in order to perform the service.

Upon request from the public agency's custodian of public records, provide the public
agency with a copy of the requested records or allow the access to public records to be
inspected or copied within a reasonable time on the same terms and conditions that the
public agency would provide the records and at a cost that does not exceed the cost
provided in this chapter or as otherwise provided by law.

Ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records
disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by law for the duration of
the contract term and following completion of the contract if the contractor does not
transfer the records to the public agency.

Upon completion of the contract, transfer, at no cost, to the public agency all public records
in possession of the contractor or meet all requirements for retaining public records and
transfer, at no cost, to the public agency all public records in possession of the contractor
or keep and maintain public records required by the public agency to perform the service.
If the contractor transfers all public records to the public agency upon completion of the
contract, the contractor shall upon termination of the contract destroy any duplicate public
records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records disclosure
requirements.

If the contractor keeps and maintains public records upon completion of the contract, the
contractor shall meet all applicable requirements for retaining public records.

All records stored electronically must be provided to the public agency, upon request from
the public agency's custodian of public records, in a format that is compatible with the
information technology systems of the public agency.

The Contractor understands that a request made to inspect or copy public records relating
to a public agency's contract for services must be made directly to the public agency;
however if the public agency does not possess the requested records, the public agency
shall immediately notify the contractor of the request, and the contractor must provide the
records to the public agency or allow the records to be inspected or copied within areasonable
time.

If a contractor does not comply with the public agency’s records request for records, the
public agency shall enforce the contract provisions in accordance with the contract.

A contractor who fails to provide the public records to the public agency within a reasonable
time may be subject to penalties under s.119.10, which include the filing of a civil action
against a contractor to compel production of public records relating to a public agency's
contract for services. The court shall assess and award against the contractor the reasonable
costs of enforcement, including reasonable attorney fees, if:

1.

The court determines that the contractor unlawfully refused to comply with the public
records request within a reasonable time; and

At least eight (8) business days before filing the action, the plaintiff provided written notice
of the public records request, including a statement that the contractor has not complied
with the request, to the public agency and to the contractor.
a. A notice complies with the requirements of this chapter if it is sent to the public
agency's custodian of public records and to the contractor at the contractor's address
listed on its contract with the public agency or to the contractor's registered agent.
b. Such notices must be sent by common carrier delivery service or by registered,
7
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Global Express Guaranteed, or certified mail, with postage or shipping paid by the
sender and with evidence of delivery, which may be in an electronic format.

A contractor who complies with a public records request within eight (8) business days
after the notice is sent is not liable for the reasonable costs of enforcement.

E-VERIFY

L. The terms contained in this paragraph shall be defined in accordance with Florida
Statute Section 448.095 “Employment Eligibility.”

2. “E-Verify system” means an Internet-based system operated by the United States
Department of Homeland Security that allows participating employers to electronically
verify the employment eligibility of newly hired employees.

3. As of January 1, 2021, a public employer (e.g., Sheriff’s Office) may not enter into
a contract with a contractor, or subcontractor unless each party to the contract registers with
and uses the E-Verify system. Every contractor who has entered or is attempting to enter
into a contract with a public employer to provide labor, supplies, or services to such
employer in exchange for salary, wages, or other remuneration; or subcontractor who is a
person or entity that provides labor, supplies, or services to or for a contractor or other
subcontractor in exchange for salary, wages, or other remuneration, shall register with and
use the E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status of all newly hired
employees.

4, If a contractor enters into a contract with a subcontractor, the subcontractor must
provide the contractor with an affidavit stating that the subcontractor does not employ,
contract with, or subcontract with an unauthorized alien.

5. A contract terminated for violating paragraph 3 above or sections 448.095
subsections (2)(c) 1 or 2, FS, is not a breach of contract and may not be considered as such.
Additionally,a contractor whose contract that is terminated as provided for in this paragraph may
not be awarded a public contract for at least 1 year after the date on which the contract was
terminated.

6. VENDOR shall, upon request, provide evidence of compliance with this provision to
SHERIFF. Failure to comply with this provision is a material breach of the Agreement, and
the SHERIFF may choose to terminate the Agreement at any time at its sole discretion.
VENDOR may be liable for all costs associated with SHERIFF securing the same services,
inclusive, but not limited to, higher costs for the same services and rebidding costs (if
necessary). VENDOR, by virtue of acceptance of the Purchase Order certifies that:

1. VENDOR and its Subcontractors are aware of the requirements of Florida Statute 448.095,

and upon request from the Sheriff’s Office, provide evidence of such compliance.

2. VENDOR and its Subcontractors are registered with and using the E-Verify system to

verify the work authorization status of newly hired employees.

3. VENDOR will not enter into a contract with any Subcontractor unless each party to the
contract registers with and uses the E-Verify system.

4. The Subcontractor will provide VENDOR with an affidavit stating that the Subcontractor

does not employ, contract with, or subcontract with unauthorized alien.

5. VENDOR must maintain a copy of such affidavit.
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6. SHERIFF may terminate this Contract on the good faith belief that the VENDOR or its
Subcontractors knowingly violated Florida Statutes 448.09(1) or 448.095(2)(c).

7. If this Contract is terminated pursuant to Florida Statute 448.095(2)(c), VENDOR may
not be awarded a public contract for at least 1 year after the date on which this Contract was
terminated.

8. VENDOR is liable for any additional cost incurred by SHERIFF as a result of the
termination of this Contract.

U. FOREIGN INFLUENCE

VENDOR represents and warrants that it has made any applicable disclosures to SHERIFF which
are required under Section 286.101(3)(a), Florida Statutes, pertaining to business transactions with a
foreign country of concern as more fully defined within said statute.

V. GRANTS

Any purchases funded through Federal Grants, including but not limited to UASI, SCHGP, and
any other federal grants shall require the VENDOR to comply with the provisions listed in 2 C.F.R.
Part 200.

W.  SUBCONTRACTORS

VENDOR agrees that as the signatory to this agreement, it is solely responsible for the satisfactory
provision of goods and services hereunder. SHERIFF does not authorize subcontractors, joint
ventures or third parties to provide goods or services in the performance of this agreement except
as identified by VENDOR in its proposal to SHERIFF. All subcontractors, joint ventures or third
parties providing goods or services in furtherance of this agreement shall be specifically identified
by VENDOR and the Scope of Work will clearly identify the specific goods and or services to be
provided by said subcontractors, joint ventures or third parties.

If the services provided by any subcontractor, joint venture or third party requires a specific
licensure, certificate, degree or other governmental authorization to provide the services, proof of
such licensure, certificate, degree or authorization will be provided by VENDOR to SHERIFF
prior to the commencement of work or the payment of any sums due to VENDOR.

X. PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT and FEE CALCULATION

Where SHERIFF and/ or eligible users of this contract pays the VENDOR within 30 days of
delivery of a vehicle, the VENDOR shall remit a fee to the Bradford County Sheriff’s Office at
one half of one percent of the total purchase amount excluding tag fees, extended warranty
purchases, and trade in allowances; per unit, that is promptly paid for. Vendor fee reporting to be
submitted monthly with payment due the 20" of the month following the reporting cycle for all
.deliveries made within month reporting.

Y. OUT-OF-SERVICE VEHICLES
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The SHERIFF has the option to dispose of out-of-service vehicles through the VENDOR. Should
the SHERIFF decide to do so, the VENDOR agrees to auction off those vehicles and payto the
SHERIFT the net auction proceeds minus transport costs and $400 vendor fee per unit.

Z. ENTIRE AGREEMENT

This Agreement contains the entire understanding between the parties regarding this Agreement
and supersedes all prior communications. The parties acknowledge and agree that neither of them
has made any representation with respect to the subject matter of this Agreement or any
representations except such representations as are specifically set forth herein, and the parties
acknowledge that they have relied on their own judgment in entering into the same. The parties
further acknowledge that any statements or representations that may have been made by either of
them to the other are void and of no effect and that neither of them has relied on such statements
or representations in connection with its dealings with the other. No alteration of these terms and
conditions is binding on SHERIFF unless signed by SHERIFF.

Z. TERM AND EXTENSION

The term for this AGREEMENT (“BCSO 22-27-1.0”) shall remain in effect for five (5) years from
the date of contract execution by the SHERIFF and may be renewed for five (5) years or extended.
by the PARTIES upon mutual agreement, in writing and executed by the PARTIES, before the
expiration of the original term or any extension thereof. SHERIFF does not agree to automatic
renewals or extensions. AGREEMENT may be extended to other governmental agencies located
in the State of Florida with vendor approval.

IN WITNESS THEREQF, the PARTIES have caused this AGREEMENT to be duly executed
as of the last day set forth below by the undersigned authorized representatives of the PARTIES.

Bradford County Sheriff’s Office

Date \ ate

Approved as to Form and Legality,
for the Reliance of the Bradford County
Sheriff, Florida
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PART 1. OEM
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PAGE 3. DELIVERY CHARGES



Price Proposal

Part 1:

Bozard Ford proposes the following percentage “profit” over dealer invoice (AFTER GOVERNMENT
CONCESSION). This percentage includes all profit, prep fees, delivery to the Bradford County Sheriff’s

Office and BCSO contract fee.

OEM Representative Models Percentage Profit

Ford Motor Company All Models available to Government 4.75%
Agencies. Including but not limited to
Police Vehicles, Sedans, Light Trucks,
SUV’s, Medium Duty Trucks (excludes

SVT and Specialty vehicles such as Raptor)



Price Proposal

Part 2:

Bozard Ford proposes a 13.5% mark up over “DEALER COST” (to include stocking expenses, freight, labor
to install), on the following Manufacturer makes whether purchased directly or through distribution.

AUTOCRANE
TIGER

CAS

GODWIN

DURACLASS (FX)

TPL LUBE BODY SKIDS
ANTEO LIFTGATES
MASTERACK
WEATHERGUARD
BETTERBUILT
MUNCIE
CHALLENGER AERIAL
ADRIAN STEEL

TOFF LINERS

WARN

ARE

KC LIGHTS

REESE

STELLAR

VMAC

AMERICAN HYDRAULIC
CRYSTEEL

HOOKLIFT

TOMMY GATE
THIEMAN LIFTGATES
LEGEND

BUYERS PRODUCTS
ENPAK/MILLER
DECKED

TRAFCON SIGNALS
READY LIFT

OX BODIES
PRO-COMP

EXTANG

LEER

DRAW-TITE

GRAPHIC DESIGNS INTERNATIONAL DECALS

ABLE2 PRODUCTS
ECCO

MAXXIMA

BROOKINGS INDUST.
FEDERAL SIGNAL

SOUND OFF SIGNAL

LIFTMOORE
VANAIR
KNAPHEIDE
RUGBY

SWITCH N GO
MAXON LIFTGATE
COMPLETE VAN BODY
KARGO MASTER
UWws

US TARP
DURALIFT AERIAL
READING BODIES
LINEX

FUEL WHEELS
AMERICAN RACING
RETRAX

THULY RACKS
AMP RESEARCH
3M WINDOW TINT
CODE 3

FENIEX

STAR WARNING

VENTURO

BOSS

CM BODIES

BLUE RIDGE

VENCO
DHOLLANDIA LIFTGATE
CONYERS MFG
PRIME DESIGN
CURT

CHELSEA

AXION AERIAL
DAKOTA BODIES
AMERICAN ALUMINUM
NITTO TIRES

TRAIL FX

MONSTER LIGHTS
FORD ACCESSORIES
WING SYSTEMS CNG
911 SIGNAL

D&R ELECTRONICS
GOLIGHT

UNITY SPOTLIGHT



WHELEN ENGINEERING ACEK9/RADIOTRONICS GO-RHINO HAVIS SHIELD

JOTTO DESK LAGUNA PRO-GARD PRISONER TRANSPORT SYS
RANCH HAND RAY ALLEN SETINA TROY PRODUCTS

WESTIN BIG SKY GUN RACKS CARGO GLIDE SANTA CRUZ GUN LOCKS
TRUCK VAULT TUFFY TUFLOC BROTHER MOBILE SOLUTIONS
GAMBER JOHNSON LUND PANASONIC RAM

SAMSUNG APOLLO VIDEO DECATUR ELECTONICS DIGITAL ALLY

GENETEC L3 MOBILE VISION POINT BLANK REARVIEW SAFETY

ROSTRA STALKER UTILITY WATCHGUARD

BAYCO MAGLIGHT PELICAN STREAMLIGHT

SURE FIRE BAKFLIP SPACEKAP WAGAN INVERTERS

KEYSTONE AUTOMOTIVE

***% CSPR - CUSTOMER SPECIAL PARTS REQUESTS WILL BE OFFERED AT THE SAME PRICING
CONTINGENT UPON AVAILABILITY. PLEASE SPECIFY MANUFACTURER, PRODUCT, DESCRIPTION AND
PART NUMBER IF POSSIBLE.



Price Proposal

Part 3:

Bozard Ford proposes a delivery charge of $ 0.35 a mile for deliveries made to any location other than
the BCSO office up to 500 miles from 540 Outlet Mall Blvd, St. Augustine, FL 32084. This fee covers
driver and fuel expense.



DEALER

DEALER

DEALER

Duval Ford
Bozard
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

PROPOSAL PO

Lowest % Markup = 56 pts 56
Second Finish =44 44
Third and beyond =0 0

STEP ONE: ENTER DEALER NAME AND BID %
STEP TWO: SORT BY CLICKING SORT BUTTON ON PERCENT ASCENDING

DEALER REPRESENTATATI

STEP THREE: VALIDATE DOCUMENTS
WERE RECEIVED IN NOTEBOOK TABS 1-
3

60 M“m%nuum _.m% MHWM_ REFERENCES OEM CERTIFICATION REGISTRATIO ONS & romww_MMaWOz FINANCIALS we
N CERTIFICATION
PO
DEALER
Duval Ford 4 3 3 4 2 2 2 3 2
Bozard 4 3 3 4 2 2 2 3 2
No Bid ] 0
No Bid 0 0
No Bid 0 0
No Bid 0 0
D o DEA 0 D ory 3 Po
o po Po 0 PO
Duval Ford 56 YES 5 DUVAL YES 4 HIGHEST 35 25 125
Bozard 44 YES S ST JOHNS YES 4 0 20 73
No Bid o NO 0 NO ] 0 ] o
No Bid [ NO ) NO [ [ ) 0
No Bid [ NO ) NO 0 0 [ 0
No Bid [ NO 0 NO 0 0 [ 0
STEP 4: CLICK STEP FIVE: CLICK COUNTY DEALER IS

YES/NO

REGISTERED IN




BRADFORD COUNTY TELEGRAPH
Published Weekly
Starke, Bradford County, Florida

Before the undersigned authority personally appeared,
Mary Goodge, personally known to me, who on oath says that

she is the publisher's assistant of the Bradford County

Telegraph, a weekly newspaper published in Starke, Bradford
County, Florida that: BRADFORD COUNTY SHERIFF’S
Office, 945-B N. Temple Ave., Starke, FL 32091, Request
for Proposal for Purchase of Motor Vehicles. Published in
said newspaper in the issue(s) of: 8/25 & 9/1/22 BCT.
Affiant further says that the said Bradford County
Telegraph is a newspaper published in Starke, in Bradford
County, Florida, and that the said newspaper has heretofore
been continuously published in said Bradford County,
Florida, each week and has been entered as second-class mail
matter at the post office in Starke, Bradford County, Florida
for a period of one year next preceding the first publication of
the attached copy of advertisement. Affiant further says that
she has never paid nor promised any person, firm, or
corporation any discount, rebate, commission, or refund for
the purpose of securing this advertisement for publication of
said newspaper.

/77 /%/'({L/k/ ]
Mary Goodge, Publisker's Assistant

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF BRADFORD

The'f?regoing i ment was acknowledged before me this
QAN day of@@m, 20873,

By: Mary Goodge who is v/ personally known to me who did (did
not) take an oath.

SO L

Notary Public - HEATHER WHEELER )

STATE OF FLORIDA
My Commission expires: July 17, 2026 -
R HEATHER WHEELER

% Commisslon # HH 242069
& Explres July 17,2026

SEAL

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL
The Bradford County Sheriff's
Office requests proposals for the
purchase of motor vehicles and
related: vehicle components for
the Fleet Management Division
and it's eligible users. Deadline f?hr
sealed proposals is September 6%,
2022 @ 10:00 AM. Please email
Major George Konke[ (george_
konkel@bradfordsheriff.org) _for
Proposal packets or see ‘our

ite; bradfordsheriff.org
webs f * B8/25 2ichg 91-BCT

v .~ A GTAL



